
Maine Department of Transportation
Tabulation oBid date 3/24/2010 EXCAVATORS-TRACKED

Region 1  Region 2  Region 3  Region 4  Region 2&4shared  
Rank Bidder Total Rank Bidder Total Rank Bidder Total Rank Bidder Total Rank Bidder Total
1 Beauregard $26,870.00 1 Beauregard $69,862.00 1 Hertz Eq $49,280.00 1 Hertz Eq $45,760.00 1 Nortrax $18,600.00
2 Hertz Eq $35,200.00 2 Hertz Eq $91,520.00 2 Beauregard $55,860.00 2 Beauregard $51,870.00 2 Hertz Eq $21,105.00
3 Milton-Cat $40,000.00 3 Milton-Cat $104,000.00 3 Milton-Cat $56,000.00 3 Milton-Cat $52,000.00 3 Eagle $21,900.00
4 Nortrax $42,000.00 4 Nortrax $58,800.00 4 Nortrax $58,800.00 4 Nortrax $54,600.00 4 Milton-Cat $30,000.00

BIDDERS Hertz Equip. Rental Beauregard Equip. Eagle Rental Milton-Cat Nortrax NE LLC
mos $/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT $/MO BID AMT

REG 1 2ea. 5 $3,520.00 $35,200.00 $2,687.00 $26,870.00 $4,000.00 $40,000.00 $4,200.00 $42,000.00
Tot Reg 1 $35,200.00 Tot Reg 1 $26,870.00 Tot Reg 1 no bid Tot Reg 1 $40,000.00 Tot Reg 1 $42,000.00

REG 2 4ea. 6 $3,520.00 $84,480.00 $2,687.00 $64,488.00 $4,000.00 $96,000.00 $4,200.00 $100,800.00
1ea. 2 $3,520.00 $7,040.00 $2,687.00 $5,374.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,200.00 $8,400.00

Tot Reg 2 $91,520.00 Tot Reg 2 $69,862.00 Tot Reg 2 no bid Tot Reg 2 $104,000.00 Tot Reg 2 $109,200.00

REG 3 3ea. 4 $3,520.00 $42,240.00 $3,990.00 $47,880.00 $4,000.00 $48,000.00 $4,200.00 $50,400.00
1ea. 2 $3,520.00 $7,040.00 $3,990.00 $7,980.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,200.00 $8,400.00

Tot Reg 3 $49,280.00 Tot Reg 3 $55,860.00 Tot Reg 3 no bid Tot Reg 3 $56,000.00 Tot Reg 3 $58,800.00

REG 4 2ea. 2 $3,520.00 $14,080.00 $3,990.00 $15,960.00 $4,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,200.00 $16,800.00
3ea, 3 $3,520.00 $31,680.00 $3,990.00 $35,910.00 $4,000.00 $36,000.00 $4,200.00 $37,800.00

Tot Reg 4 $45,760.00 Tot Reg 4 $51,870.00 Tot Reg 4 no bid Tot Reg 4 $52,000.00 Tot Reg 4 $54,600.00

R- 2&41ea. 3 $7,035.00 $21,105.00 N/Q $7,300.00 $21,900.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $6,200.00 $21,700.00
shared Tot R- 2&4 $21,105.00 Tot R- 2&4 Tot R- 2&4 $21,900.00 Tot R- 2&4 $30,000.00 Tot R- 2&4
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