Maine Department of Transportation

Proposals Received

Snow Plowing Rest Areas

[-95

Bid Date: 9/30/2009

Proposals Received Hampden N/B Hampden S/B  Houlton
Lee's General Trucking No Bid No Bid No Bid
Thompson Contracting No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gordon Landscape & Hydroseed $22,222.00 $22,221.00 $44,443.00
John Thayer /JRT Plowing & Sanding $7,450.00 $7,950.00 No Bid
Gary M Pomeroy Companies $14,800.00 $14,800.00 No Bid
Nelson Construction No Bid No Bid $8,950.00
Bangor Abatement Inc $11,750.00 $11,750.00 $23,999.00
Jackett Enterprises No Bid No Bid $5,800.00
Steelstone Industries No Bid No Bid $16,262.50
Tolman Construction No Bid No Bid No Bid
Timothy Richardson $9,600.00 $9,600.00 No Bid




