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Historical Perspectives 
 
 
Independent Spent Fuel Storage Installation (ISFSI) 
 
In 1998 the Department of Energy (DOE) was required to take title and possession of the nation’s spent nuclear 
fuel as mandated by the Nuclear Waste Policy Act (NWPA) of 1982.  When the NWPA was enacted, Congress 
assumed that a national repository would be available for the disposal of the spent fuel.  Since the licensing and 
construction of the high level waste repository at Yucca Mountain in Nevada had experienced significant delays, 
DOE is currently projecting that the Yucca Mountain site will not be available until at least the year 2020 or later. 
 
DOE’s inaction prompted Maine Yankee to construct an ISFSI during decommissioning to store the more than 
1434 spent fuel assemblies that were previously housed in the spent fuel pool in the plant, into 60 storage casks on-
site.  Another four casks contain some of the more radioactive components of the reactor internals that were cut up 
during decommissioning, since their radioactive concentrations were too high to dispose at a low level radioactive 
waste facility.  These are expected to be shipped along with the spent fuel to the Yucca site should the repository 
open.  Since then the Obama Administration and Energy Secretary Chu have advocated that the Yucca Mountain 
site is no longer a viable option for disposing of the nation’s high level waste and spent nuclear fuel and plan to 
assemble a Blue Ribbon Panel of experts to review alternative strategies for managing these waste forms.   
 
 
Environmental 
 
Since 1970 the State has maintained an independent, radiological environmental monitoring program of the 
environs around Maine Yankee.  Over the years there was an extensive quarterly sampling and analysis program 
that included such media as salt and fresh water, milk, crabs, lobsters, fish, fruits, vegetables, and air.  Since the 
decommissioning the State’s program has been reduced twice to accommodate decreased revenues for sample 
analyses at the State’s Health and Environmental Testing Laboratory (HETL).  Presently, the State monitors one 
freshwater location, one saltwater and seaweed location, and one air sample location.  The State maintains a 
quarterly sampling regimen, except for the air sample, which is performed bi-weekly near the old Bailey Farm 
House.  Besides the media sampling, over the years the State has maintained a robust thermoluminescent dosimeter 
(TLD) program to measure the radiation environment.  The TLDs were placed within a 10 to 20 mile radius of the 
plant to measure the background radiation levels and later, when the plant was operating, any potential increases in 
background levels due to plant operations.  Over time the number of TLDs nearly doubled to address public 
concerns over the clam flats in Bailey Cove and the construction of the ISFSI.  After the plant’s decommissioning 
the State reduced the number of TLDs around Bailey Cove, but maintained the same number for the environmental 
surveillance of the ISFSI.  A further evaluation of reducing the State’s radiological environmental monitoring 
program is planned for the fall of 2009. 
 
 
Maine Yankee Decommissioning 
 
Maine Yankee’s decommissioning was completed in the fall of 2005.  At that time the State Nuclear Safety 
Inspector (SNSI) also commenced his final walk down survey of the site.  Certain areas such as the transportation 
routes exiting the plant site were surveyed after the plant industrial area was decommissioned.  Due to the length of 
the egress routes, it took a considerable amount of time to complete both half-mile east and west access routes and 
the two thirds of a mile of the railroad track.  In addition, seven specific areas, including the dirt road, were also 
examined as part of the final site survey.  The State’s final survey of the dirt road leading to the old softball field 
was extended in the fall of 2007 when the State discovered three localized elevated areas on the road that were 
contaminated.  At that time, extensive bounding samples were taken to determine the extent of the contamination.   
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Because of the State’s findings the original Class III designation of little or no potential for small areas of elevated 
activity was deemed incorrect.  Therefore, the Dirt Road systematic sampling was necessary to ensure that all the 
State’s findings would still pass Maine Yankee’s License Termination Plan (LTP) Class I criteria.  The State and 
Maine Yankee findings both indicated that the random concentration of the Cesium-137 was low and comparable 
to what is normally found in nature from past weapons testing during the 1950’s and 1960’s.  On October 31st the 
State issued a letter to Maine Yankee stating that, based on the recent systematic sampling and bounding efforts on 
the elevated areas, the results demonstrated that Maine Yankee had met its Class I LTP criteria.  Therefore, the 
State concluded that there were no further outstanding issues relative to the Dirt Road and considered the issue 
closed.  Even though some residual radioactivity remains, due to the localized nature of the contaminant and the 
restricted security access to the site, the contamination found does not present a public health hazard. 
 
With the closure of the Dirt Road, the only remaining walk down survey left to be performed on-site is the portion 
of the East Access Road adjacent to the ISFSI bermed area.  This area remains as the background radiation levels 
from the ISFSI were initially too high to survey, (greater than 30,000 counts per minute), and could mask potential 
elevated areas.  Since then the State has been monitoring the levels every spring and has observed a steady 
decrease in the ambient radiation levels down to 25,000 counts per minute (cpm).  When the levels reach about 
20,000 cpm the area will be surveyed to close out all transportation routes at the Maine Yankee site. 
 
The State will publish its decommissioning findings in a confirmatory summary that is expected in October of 
2009.  As part of that process the State will condense over 40 major survey areas into eleven confirmatory reports 
that are being worked on by an outside consultant.  The independent consultant has been collecting all the State’s 
findings and summarizing them in confirmatory reports that the State Nuclear Safety Inspector will use to 
complete the State’s confirmatory summary. 
 
 
Groundwater Monitoring Program 
 
In June of 2004, the State, through the Department of Environmental Protection’s (DEP) authority under 38 MRSA 
§1455, signed an agreement with Maine Yankee for a five year, post decommissioning radiological groundwater 
monitoring program at the site.  Presently, the program is in its fourth year.  The details of how the agreement 
would be carried out relative to the quality assurance facets of the monitoring, sampling and analyses would be 
captured in Maine Yankee’s Radiological Groundwater Monitoring Work Plan. 
 
The normal sampling regimen for the groundwater monitoring program is March, June and September of each 
year.  However, since the first sampling took place in September of 2005, the annual sampling constitutes the 
September sampling of the current calendar year and finishes with the June sampling of the following year. 
 
It should be noted that the Agreement between the State and Maine Yankee set an administrative limit of 2 mrems 
per year per well as a demonstration that it has met the State’s groundwater decommissioning standards of a 4 
mrem dose per year above background values.  If a well exceeds the 2 mrem value after the five year monitoring 
program ends, Maine Yankee would allow the State to continue monitoring that well.  To-date fifteen of the 
sixteen wells sampled have not exceeded one tenth of the limit, or 0.2 mrems/yr.  Only well number MW-502 has 
come close to exceeding the 2 mrems administrative limit and that was back in March of 2006 when the dose was 
1.96 mrems.  Since then the Tritium in this well has been steadily decreasing.  It is expected that this well will 
remain elevated for some time as the water infiltration rates are very low.  Consequently, the decrease will be slow 
and steady. 
 


