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State Contract — Eastland Woolen Mill Site, Corinna, ME :
(Bill #4) State's share (10%) of costs incurred at site for !
the period between April 1, 2009 — December 31, 2010 i

See attached: $91,287.76
Payment is due 75 days from receipt of bill.

In accordance with treasury fiscal requirements, Federal
Agencies are required to charge interest on accounts
receivable outstanding in excess of thirty days. The
current rate in effect 10/1/10 through 9/30/11 is .69%.
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Report Date; 02/14/2011 Trips: 3110840550126 Page 1 of 1
Report Time: 02:49 PM

IFMS Reconciliation Pending
Contract Costs Verification
EASTLAND WOOLEN MILL, CORINNA, ME SITEID =01 T6
CRP# 106605 AC =FE,LR,R,RA

INTERAGENCY AGREEMENT (IAG) COSTS

Federal Agency: ARMY CORPS OF ENGINEERS 5

IAG Number: DW96940306

Project Officer(s): DINARDO, FILOMENA

SHEWACP? OBERT

Dates of Service: From; 04!921'2{-)68 To: 03/02/2009

Summary of Service: Remedial action

Total Costs: $270,503.91

Voucher Voucher Voucher Fund Schedule Site  Site CRP
’Number Date Amount Code Date Amount  Project Number
v EST#86 04/09/2009 48,230.80 T 04/16/2009 48,230.80 01T6RAD1 106605
/61022842 04/13/2009 937.99 TCD 04/23!200_9 937.99 0O1T6RAC1 106605
J 61023080 05/05/2009 287.78 TCD 05/15/2009 287.78 01T6RA01 106605
/61023325 06/05/2009 180.01 TCD 06/22/2009 180.01 01T6RAD1 106605
/ 278408 4* 05/19/2010 220,867.33 T 05/19/2010  220,867.33 01T6RA0T 106605

Total: $270,503.91
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Trips: 3110840550127

Report Date: 02/14/20 1 Page 1 0of2
Report Time: 02:49 PM
IFMS Reconciliation Pending
Contract Costs Verification
EASTLAND WOOLEN MILL, CORINNA, ME SITEID =01 T6
RESPONSE ACTION (RAC) CONTRACT COSTS
Contracior Name: NOBIS ENGINEERING, INC.
EPA Contract Number: EPS10603
Delivery Order Information DO # Start Date End Date
09/30/2008 10/29/2010
B2————02/04/2010———09/36/2640-
Project Officer(s): SAWAYA,%E{’?I?OI%N, ROSANNE
Dates of Service: From: 09/38/286068  To: 10/29/2010
Summary of Service: RESPONSE ACTION CONTRACT-SUBCLASS(REDI)
Total Costs: sesorzes. (plf7 Z13.1 5
Voucher Voucher Voucher Fund Schedule Site  Site CRP
Number Date Amount _ Code Date Amount _ Project Number
JAOZQ 03/19/2009 63,867.24 TCD 04/15/2009 63,867.24 01T6LRO1 106605
/030 04/16/2009 78,160.63 TCD 05/12/2009 78,160.63 01T6LRO1 106605
1AD31 05/14/2009 114,415.50 T 06/08/2009 18,395.55 01T6LR0O1 106605
AOS‘I] 05/14/2009 114,415.50 TCD 06/08/2009 96,019.95 01T6LRO1 106605
'A032 06/18/2009 12,571.80 T 07/15/2009 12,571.80 01T6LRO1 106605
'A033 07/16/2009 19,412.09 T 08/12/2009 19,412.09 01T6LROT 106605
‘A034 08/20/2009 8,033.93 T 09/15/2009 8,033.93 01T6LR0O1 106605
A035 09/17/2009 7,508.45 T 10/13/2009 7,508.45 01T6LRO1 106605
In036 10/15/2009 62,867.21 T 11/09/2009 62,867.21 01T6LRO1 106605
‘AQ37 11/19/2009 24,381.97 T 12/15/2009 24,381.97 01T6LRO1 106605
/A038 12117/2009 15,559.52 T 01/12/2010 15,559.52 01T6LR0O1 106605
;A039 01/14/2010 11,612.24 T 02/08/2010 11,612.24 01T6LRO1 106605
'A040 02/18/2010 16,205.02 T 03/16/2010 16,205.02 01T6LR0O1 106605
A4 03/18/2010 11,787.54 T 04/1212010 11,787.54 01T6LR0O1 106605
A042 04/15/2010 18,215.54 T 05/11/2010 9,037.68 01T6LR0OT 106605
A042} 04/15/2010 18,215.54 T 05/11/2010 9,177.86 01T6LRO1 106605
‘IAO43 05/20/2010 23,785.50 T 06/14/2010 23,785.50 01T6LRO1 108605
044 06/17/2010 15,632.65 T 07/13/2010 15,632.66 01T6LRO1 106605




Trips: 3110840550127

Report Date: 02/14/201 1 Page 2 of 2
Report Time: 02:49 PM
IFMS Reconciliation Pending
Contract Costs Verification
EASTLAND WOOLEN MILL, CORINNA, ME SITEID=01T6

RESPONSE ACTION (RAC) CONTRACT COSTS

Contractor Name: NOBIS ENGINEERING, INC.

EPA Confract Number: EPS10603

Delivery Order Information DO # Start Date End Date

1038 09/30/2008 10/29/2010
52 02/04/2010 09/30/2010

Project Officer(s): SAWAYAOQOBRIEN, ROSANNE

Dates of Service: From: 09/30/2008  To: 10/29/2010

Summary of Service: RESPONSE ACTION CONTRACT-SUBCLASS(REDI)

Total Cosls: $660,477.98

Voucher Voucher Voucher Fund Schedule Site  Site CRP
Number Date Amount Code Date Amount Project Number
/n045 07/2212010 77,371.62 T 08/18/2010 77,371.62 01T6LR0O1 106605
/}\046 08/19/2010 27,075.81 09/14/2010 27,075.81 01T6LRO1 106605
}A047 09/16/2010 9,661.90 T 10/14/2010 9,661.90 01T6LRO1 106605
/A048 10/14/2010 15,404.54 T 11/10/2010 15,404.54 01T6LRO1 106605
/A049 11/18/2010 8,843.02 T 12/14/2010 8,843.02 01T6LRO1 106605

Total: $642,373.73




Trips: 3110840550128

Hewett, Rebecca L

From: Buonopane.Joan@epamail.epa.gov
Sent: Wednesday, March 02, 2011 3:05 PM
To: Hewett, Rebecca L
Subject: RE: Eastland Weolen Mill SSC bill #4 - revised
Attachments: eastland bill #4 revised_pdf
jb§
eastland bill #4
revised.pdf (...

.here you go. let me know if this works, Joan
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|RE: Eastland Woolen Mill SSC bill #4 - revised
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Trips: 3110840550128

Hi Joan,

Could you possibly send me a pdf copy of the invoice.
than you so when I open the document, changes occur.

Thanks. Becky

————— Original Message-----

From: Buonopane.Joan@epamail.epa.gov
[mailto:Bucnopane.Joan@epamall.epa.gov]

Sent: Wednesday, March 02, 2011 2:51 PM

To: Hewett, Rebecca L

Subject: Eastland Woolen Mill SSC bill #4 - revised
Rebecca,

as we discussed, I am attaching a revised SSC bill.
date of receipt..

I appreciate yvour contacting me. please let me know

(See attached file: 01T6 bill #4 revised.docx)

I have a different version of word

we will consider today as the new

if vou need anything else, Joan




